
Friends of 
St Mary’s Adderbury 

 
 

Become a Friend and 
contribute to the upkeep of 

our beautiful Church for  
today and future generations 

 

 
 

Website: www.adderbury.org/FOSMA 

Maintaining the Church in the  

21st Century  

Well over a decade ago the community of Adderbury 
set about raising funds and seeking grants for the 
external refurbishment of St Mary’s Church which 
was in a poor condition. The initial campaign, by the 
St Mary’s Adderbury Rescue Team (SMART), 
financed major restoration work on the Church in 
stages from 2005. 
 

 
 
Such was the success of the campaign; it was 
decided to set up a more permanent body to 
continue to raise funds for maintaining the fabric of 
the Church into the future. 
 

The Friends of St Mary’s Adderbury (FOSMA) 
was duly formed in March 2009 as a registered 
charity (No:1136252)  
 

In recent years FOSMA has raised more than 
£150,000 from a series of successful and enjoyable 
events, generous donations, and friendship fees.  
 

FOSMA contributed to the PCC for the repair of the 
outside stonework including two new gargoyles 
around the tower and the cleaning of the rare 
medieval musicians’ frieze.  
 
 

Other restorations FOSMA funded included the 
south window (shown earlier); the Lychgate 
 

  
 

and a new wrought iron gate in the South Porch 
 

 
 

Further window refurbishment is planned, along  
with improvements to the heating system - with the 
help of a very generous donation, 

Join us on our Journey! 

Any queries? Contact us on  

01295 811059 

https://d.docs.live.net/4416e56c34fef944/Documents/Debby's%20Files/FOSMA/FOSMA%20Leaflet%20MAY2023/www.adderbury.org/FOSMA


Friends of St Mary’s Adderbury 

FOSMA 
 

BECOMING A FRIEND 
 

MEMBERSHIP RATES 

£15 Individual - annual 

£25 Two adults, same address - annual  

£200 Individual – Life         

£300 Two adults, same address – Life 

£50 Corporate – annual 

 

Pay by cheque, BACS or Standing Order 
 

Paying by Standing Order is a great help. It 

ensures regular payments are received by FOSMA 

and avoids the risk of forgetting to renew your 

annual membership. 
 

If you are a taxpayer, you may wish to complete the 

Gift Aid declaration below. This enables FOSMA to 

claim back 25% from the Inland Revenue at no 

expense to you.  
 

 Gift Aid Declaration 
 

I am a UK taxpayer and would like the Friends 

of St Mary’s Adderbury to claim back the tax on 

all my donations until further notice. I confirm 

payment of an amount of income tax / capital 

gains tax at least equal to the tax reclaim. 

 

Signed……………………………………… 

 

Date…………………………………………… 
 

Charity No. 1136252  

 

FRIENDS OF ST MARY’S ADDERBURY  

MEMBERSHIP APPLICATION 

  

I/We wish to become a Friend/Friends of St 

Mary’s Adderbury 

 

Name:  

..................................................................... 
Address:  

 

..................................................................... 

 

Post Code:  ………. 

 

Telephone: .......................................  

 

E Mail: ..............................................                    

 

Please tick as appropriate: 

o I enclose a cheque for £…    payable 

to Friends of St Mary’s Adderbury 

o I/we will pay by BACS to: 

           Friends of St Mary’s Adderbury   

           A/c 01550061 Sort code 30-90-42 

o I/we will pay by annual standing 

order 

 

PLEASE RETURN THIS FORM TO:                    

FOSMA Secretary, Archway Cottage, 

Tanners Lane, Adderbury OX17 3ET  

 

 

 

 

STANDING ORDER MANDATE 

To:  

The Manager……………………………… 

Bank/Building Society 

Address: 

.....................................................................

................................ 

Sort Code: ....../....../....              

 

A/c No: ........................................... 

 

A/c Name: ............................................... 

 

Please pay the sum of £............      

(..................................  pounds) 

 

On (date)....................................annually to: 

 

Friends of St Mary’s Adderbury 

Lloyds Bank, Banbury 

Sort Code 30-90-42 

A/c number 01550061  

 

 

Signature...................................................     

 

Date................................ 

 

 


